State Building Code Subcommiittee of Building Officials
Meeting
Tuesday, May 13, 2014

Department of Accounting and General Services
Comptroller’s Conference Room 410
Kalanimoku Building
1151 Punchbow] Street
Honolulu, Hawaii 96813

West Hawaii Civic Center
Building “E”, First Floor
74-5044 Ane Keohokalole Highway
Kailua-Kona, Hawaii 96740

Telephone Call-In - 800-910-8278 then 6547519

MINUTES

1. Call to Order — 8:33 am.

2. Attendees:  Tim Hiu Ryan Takahashi
Doug Haigh Robert Aquino
Jai Ho Cheng (via telephone) Stella Kam
Glen Ueno Jim Reinhardt
Al Lardizabal Socrates Bratakos
Peter HM. Lee Lloyd Rogers
Neal Fujii Howard Wiig
Thad Tomei Aaron Ackerman
Kraig Stevenson (via telephone) Ken Takenaka
Shannon Alivado Pat Onesta
Sherman Wong Bill Brizee

Yo Ratanapeanchai

3. Neal Fujii submitted a memorandum dated May 13, 2014 (see attachment), proposing
amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC). After much discussion, the
Subcommittee did not incorporate any of the proposals into the 2012 UPC.

4. The Subcommittee discussed the working document submitted by Tim Hiu of the Hawaii
Administrative Rules adopting the 2012 UPC (see attachment). The Subcommittee
approved the adoption of the 2012 UPC with amendments. Tim Hiu will present the
2012 UPC with these amendments at the next State Building Code Council meeting on
June 10, 2014.

5. No Subcommittee meeting in June.

6. Adjournment —9:14 a.m.

Attachments: Memorandum dated May 13, 2014, from Neal Fujii (DLNR)
2012 State Plumbing Code (draft by Tim Hiu)



State of Hawaii
Department of Land and Natural Resources
COMMISSION ON WATER RESOURCE MANAGEMENT
P.O. Box 621
Honolulu, HI 96809

May 13, 2014
MEMORANDUM

TO: Mr. Douglas Haigh and Mr. Timothy F.T. Hiu
State Building Code Subcommittee of Building Officials

FROM: Neal Fuijii, State Drought and Water Conservation Coordinator
SUBJECT:  Adoption of 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code: Proposed Amendment

This is to submit proposed amendments to the 2012 IAMPO Uniform Plumbing Code (2012
UPC), which is under consideration for adoption by the State Building Code Council in its
process of updating the State’s suite of building codes.

Background

The Commission on Water Resource Management (Commission) has a responsibility to protect
the public trust water resources of the state, which includes water conservation programs and
practices. The Commission completed its Hawaii Water Conservation Plan in 2012 (Plan),
which identifies implementation actions to improve water conservation and efficiency in Hawaii.
The following policy action is recommended in the Plan (p. 7-14):

Explore policy changes to make improvements in water use efficiency and related
reporting (e.g., State Water Code, green plumbing codes [IAMPO; ICC], county
ordinances, efc.) via the State Building Code Council, Hawaii Legislature, and County
Councils. (P3).

The Plan also recommends a priority program element for implementation (p. 7-4):

Model Ordinance for Landscape and Irrigation Design — Implementation Program:
Development of a statewide, model landscape and irrigation design code that
emphasizes water use efficiency; and providing assistance to local governments to aid in
adoption.

The IAMPO 2012 Green Plumbing & Mechanical Code Supplement contains numerous water
efficiency requirements which are more progressive and water efficient than current code (and
2012 UPC) requirements. These provisions affect plumbing fixtures, HVAC, rain water
catchment, landscaping, gray water and use of recycled water. The adoption of these
provisions will help to implement the Plan priority implementation actions noted above.

Proposed Addenda to IAMPO UPC 2012

1. Adoption of the following Chapters in the JAMPO 2012 Green Plumbing & Mechanical
Code Supplement.



Chapter 4 Water Efficiency and Conservation

Chapter 5 Alternate Water Sources for Non-Potable Applications
Appendix A Method of Calculating Water Savings

Appendix B Potable Rainwater Catchment Systems

2. Adoption of additional requirements that plumbing fixtures and equipment have EPA
WaterSense and/or Energy Star certification whenever it is applicable.

There is another proposed amendment to the 2012 UPC, involving the 2012 International Green
Construction Code — Water Efficiency Provisions. This IgCC proposal is complimentary and
similar to this memo and could work in conjunction should they also be adopted. Thank you for
the opportunity to comment on this important process of updating Hawaii's Building Codes.

Feel free to contact me at 808-587-0264 to discuss this matter.



DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL SERVICES

Amendment of Chapter 3-183
Hawaii Administrative Rules

SUMMARY

1. Chapter 183 of Title 3, Hawaii Administrative Rules, entitled “State Plumbing Code,” is
amended to read as follows:



HAWAII ADMINISTRATIVE RULES
TITLE 3
DEPARTMENT OF ACCOUNTING AND GENERAL SERVICES
SUBTITLE 14
STATE BUILDING CODE COUNCIL
CHAPTER 183

STATE PLUMBING CODE

Subchapter 1 Rules of General Applicability

§3-183-1 Purpose

§3-183-2 Scope

§3-183-3 Definitions

§3-183-4 Adoption of the Uniform Plumbing Code
§3-183-5 Permit Authorization

Subchapter 2 Amendments to the [2006] 2012 JAPMO Uniform Plumbing Code

§3-183-6 Title

§3-183-6.1 __ Organization and Enforcement
§3-183-7 Definitions

§3-183-8 General Regulations

§3-183-9 Plumbing Fixtures and Fixture Fittings
§3-183-10 Sanitary Drainage

§3-183-11 Vents

§3-183-12 Storm Drainage

§3-183-13  [GrayWaterSystems] Alternate Water Sources for Nonpotable

: . Applications,
§3-183-14  [Appendix K — Private Sewage Disposal Systems]

s3-183-15 _ Reference Standards, =

Historical Note: Chapter 183 [js] was added to Title 3 of the Hawaii Administrative Rules k
- STSaptutoeii gV U o 0 o o i g e o ,_,._.\" \\(Formatted:

[Effective ]

.---=1 Formatted:

Strikethrough

% .- Formatted:

| Underline

Font: Arial, Not Bold,

Underline

Formatted:

Font: Not Bold,

! Underline

., | Formatted:

Font: Not Bold,

( Formatted:

Indent: First line: 0.5"

| Formatted:

Underline

“-=-{ Formatted:

Strikethrough

( Formatted:

No underline

-

“{ Formatted:

Underline

-“:\ Formatted:

Underline

Indent: First fine: 0.5"

" '{ Formatted:

Underline

'\ Formatted:

Strikethrough

SOV | NS | Y, S L O KUY, VDY SO L SO | N | Y




SUBCHAPTER 1
RULES OF GENERAL APPLICABILITY

§3-183-1 Purpose. The purpose of this chapter is to adopt the state plumbing code as
required by Section 107-25, Hawaii Revised Statutes (HRS).
[Eff 1{Auth: HRS §107-29)(imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-2 Scope. This chapter sets forth minimum requirements for the design,

installation, alteration, repair, and construction of plumbing and drainage systems, and

shall apply to all new construction, relocation, alteration, repair or reconstruction.
}{(Auth: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS §107-224, 107-25)

§3-183-3 Definitions. In this chapter, unless the context otherwise requires:

“Chapter’” means chapter of this HAR Chapter 183-3.

“IAPMQO" means the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical

Officials, | Deleted: {

“UPC” means the Uniform Plumbing Code as published by the International Association
of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials.

“Section” means a section of a chapter of the Uniform Plumbing Code.
[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS §107-24, 1007-25)

§3-183-4 Adoption of the Uniform Plumbing Code. The “Uniform Plumbing Code,

[2006) 2012 Edition” including Jall} appendices A, B, C, G, and | as copyrighted and ___  _..-{ Formatted: Strikethrough
published by International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, 5001 East  { kormatted: Strikethrough

Philadelphia Street, Ontario, CA 91761-2816 is adopted by reference and made a part
of this chapter. This incorporation by reference includes all parts of the Uniform
Plumbing Code subject to the amendments hereinafter set forth. The IAPMO, Uniform

Plumbing Code, [2066] 2012 edition is made a part of the chapter, subject to the _...—{ Formatted: Strikethrough

amendments provided in this chapter.
[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-5 Permit Authorization. Each county may, by ordinance, require that a permit
be obtained from the Building Official for any area regulated by this chapter.
[Eff 1(Auth: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

_ﬂ_,wi( Deleted: §




SUBCHAPTER 2
AMENDMENTS TO THE [2006] 2012 IAPMO UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

§3-183-6 Title. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

“101.1 Title. This document shall be known as the “[Uniform-Plumbing-Code™6f .--{ Formatted: Strikethrough

the-State-of Hawaii] State of Hawaii Plumbing Code, and may be cited as such,

and will be referred to herein as “this code”.
[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-6.1 Organization and Enforcement. Section 102 is amended to read:

“102 Organization and Enforcement. In accordance to HRS 107 the
provisions of this code are State standards and are enforced when adopted by
the counties or as an interim code if the counties fail to adopt. Provisions for
licensing of design professionals and any person to perform plumbing work shall
be in accordance to HRS 444, 448E and 464.”

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §46-1.5)(Imp: HRS §448E-4, 464-2)

§3-183-7 Definitions.
Section 204.0 is amended to read as follows:

“204.0 -B-

Building Drain — That part of the lowest piping of a drainage system that
receives the discharge from soil, waste, and other drainage pipes inside the walls
of buildings and conveys it to the building sewer beginning fiwe-{2}-feet{610
)] five (5) feet (1524 mm) outside the building wall.”

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

Section 210.0 is amended to add the following:

“210.0 -H-

Health Officer — Health Officer shall mean the Director of Health of the
Department of Health, State of Hawaii, or the Director’s authorized agent.”
[Eff 1 (Auth: HRS §107-29)(Iimp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)




Section 218 is amended to read as follows;

“218.0-P,

Plumbing System - Includes all potable water, building supply and distribution .4

pipes all reclaimed water systems. all plumbing fixtures and traps, all drainage
and vent pipe(s), and all building drains including their respective joints and
connection, devices, receptors, and appurtenances within the property lines of
the premises and shall include potable water piping, potable water treating or
using equipment, medical gas and medical vacuum systems, and water heaters
and vents for same.

_ Section 210.9 is amended to add the following:

221.0 -S-
common stack serves as a drainage pipe as well as a vent pipe.”
[Eff 1(Auth: HRS §107-29)(imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-8 General Regulations.
Section 301.2 is amended by adding a third paragraph to read:

The use of the International Plumbing Code may be used in lieu of the
Uniform Plumbing Code when approved by the administrative authority. A
written request by a Hawaii licensed mechanical engineer with the concurrence
of the building or project owner must be made to the administrative authority.
The details of this approval shall be recorded and entered in the files of the
department. Plans submitted shall be stamped by the Hawaii licensed
mechanical engineer. This section shall only apply to a new building or project
and shall not be applied in conjunction with an existing building. Provision of the

Uniform Plumbing Code and the International Plumbing Code shall not be
combined or interchanged unless approved by the administrative authority.
Plans submitted shall clearly state on the submitted title, plumbing and/or
mechanical sheets that the International Plumbing Code was used as the basis

of design.

Section 314.8 is renumbered to read:

“[314.8] 313.8 Seismic Supports. Where earthquake load are applicable in
accordance with the building code, plumbing piping supports shall be designed
and installed for the seismic forces in accordance with the building code.”

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS §107-29)(Imp: HRS
§107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-9 Plumbing Fixtures and Fixture Fittings.

-1 Formatted: Font: Bold

Formatted: Underline

.- Deleted: §

-+ Formatted: No underline

1 Formatted: Underline

“{ Formatted: No underline

-1 Formatted: Indent: Left: 0"




Section [412] 422, Table [4-1;-and-Fable-A] 422.1 are deleted in their entirety, .-

and replaced to read as follows:

“[442-0] 422.0 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures. Plumbing fixtures
shall be provided for the type of bu:ldlng occupancy and in the minimum number
required in Chapter 29 of the International Building Code.”

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-10 Sanitary Drainage. Section 715.1 is amended to read as follows:

“715.1 Materials. The building sewer, beginning [twe-{2}-feet{618-mm)] five (5)
feet (1524 mm) from any building or structure shall be of such materials as
prescribed in this code.”

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-11 [Vents—Section 011.0is-added-toveadasfollows: -

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107- ~29) (Imp- HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-12 Storm Drainage. Section 1101.11.1 is amended to read as follows:

“4101.11.1 Primary Roof Drainage. Roof areas of a building shall be drained by
roof drains or gutters. The location and sizing of drains and gutters shall be
coordinated with the structural design and pitch of the roof. Unless otherwise
required by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, roof drains, gutters, vertical
conductors or leaders, and horizontal storm drains for primary drainage shall be
sized based on a storm of sixty (60) minutes duration and 100 year return period.
Refer to [Table-B-1+-1{in-Appendix-B)] the National Weather Service rainfall map
for 100-year, 80-minute storms at various locations.”

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

§3-183-13 [Gray-Water-Systems—General] “ALTERNATE WATER SOURCES FOR

NONPOTABLE APPLICATIONS”

?r Formatted: Strikethrough

"~ Formatted: Strikethrough

--4 Formatted: Strikethrough

{ Formatted: Strikethrough

o { Formatted: Strikethrough

“ Formatted: Strikethrough




system-shall-be-permitied:"]
[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

Section 1601.3 is amended to read as follows:

“1601.3 Permit or Approval
It shall be unlawful for any person to construct, install, or alter, or cause to be
constructed, installed, or altered [; ] an alternate water_source ..--{ Formatted: Strikethrough )

system in a building or on a premises without first obtaining a permit or approval to
do such work from the Authority Having Jurisdiction.”
[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

-1 Formatted: Strikethrough ]

Eff 1 (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

J{ Formatted: Strikethrough }

/]
[Eff 1 (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

Section 1602.7 is amended to read as follows:

“1602.7 Drawings and Specifications. The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall
require the following information to be included with or in the plot plan before a
permit or_approval is issued for a gray water system, or at a time during the
construction thereof:”

w.----="1 Formatted: Indent: Left: 1", First }
"{ Formatted: Strikethrough }
‘( Formatted: Indent: Left: 1", First
: line: 0"

.




LA = GW. ~
A e e L e e e 3
ETxPEX 082
g S S ko U e ke

[Eff 1 (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

{

{ Formatted: Strikethrough

p—

i
i

-1 Formatted: Indent: Left: 1", First

line: 0"

1

Formatted: Strikethrough

1 Formatted: Strikethrough

o

4

i

Formatted: Strikethrough

[ Formatted: Strikethrough

-1 Formatted: Strikethrough

fr?

Formatted: Strikethrough

Formatted: Strikethrough

Formatted: Indent: Left: 1", First
line: 0"

!
i

Formatted: Strikethrough

L L S N




Space Before: 0 pt,

: O pt
1

Formatted

After
Deleted

I
1
i
p
i
-




-1 Formatted: Strikethrough

’ Formatted: Strikethrough

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

i Formatted: Strikethrough )
as-allewed-by-Section-301-0-of this-cede].

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)
--{ Formatted: Indent: Left: 1" I
"{ Formatted: Strikethrough j
-1 Formatted: Strikethrough 7
. . b
v Formatted: Strikethrough ]
Streams-and-lakes 5015, 240-mym) 50 H45:240-mm) .| Formatted: Strikethrough T
; ; | Formatted: Strikethrough J
s -{ Formatted: Strikethrough )
i@ ' { Formatted: Strikethrough )
| Formatted: Strikethrough ]

{

~------1 Formatted: Indent: Left: 1"

-10 -



Type-ofSoil (galiday) I of |
48 6:6
Sandyloam 44 3
42 89
Glayloam 68 1
Silty-clay 0:6 6
223 &0

-11 -

_...--~1 Formatted: Strikethrough

__...---1 Formatted: Strikethrough




--~| Formatted: Strikethrough

art-of-this-chapter: ‘"“{Formatted: Indent: Left: 1"

N N

[Eff ] (Auth: HRS §107-29) (Imp: HRS §107-24, 107-25)

Section §3-183-14 Appendix K Private Sewage Disposal Systems: is deleted
in it's entirety

. { Formatted: Strikethrough

e { Formatted: Strikethrough

-12 -



U Formatted: Strikethrough

_..---1 Formatted: Strikethrough

durisdiction] ___..---{ Formatted: Strikethrough

-13 -



Table-K-6-is-added-as-attached ]

A new section §3-183-15 is added.

§3-183-15 Referenced Standards

Table 14-1 is amended by adding between Standard Number SAE-J1670-
2008 and TCNA A118-1-2011* to read:

__..---1 Formatted: Strikethrough

<= Formatted: Indent: Left: 1"

[ Standard I Standard Title [ Application | Referenced

214 -



Number Sections
State of Hawaii — Standard Details for Public : .
Rev. Sept. 2000 Works Construction Various Various
State ggggwan - Water System Standards Various Various

2. The adoption of Chapter 183 of Title 3, Hawaii Administrative Rules, shall
take effect ten days after filing with the Office of the Lieutenant Governor.

3. Material, except source notes, to be deleted is shown by strikethrough
and brackets. New material is underscored.

I certify that the foregoing are copies of the rules, drafted in the Ramseyer
format pursuant to the requirements of section 91-4.1, Hawaii Revised Statutes,
which were adopted on and filed with the Office of the
Lieutenant Governor.

Chair
State Building Code Council

Director
Department of Accounting and
General Services

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Deputy Attorney General

-15-



